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About the book  

Clay’s Handbook of Environmental Health, since its first publication in 1933, has provided a definitive guide for the 
environmental health practitioner or reference for the consultant or student. This twentieth edition continues as a 
first point of reference,  Although focused on the curriculum of the UK’s Chartered Institute of Environmental Health 
and dealing with the UK situation, underlying this are international public and environmental health principles which 
should, taking account of the impact of climate change,readily suit the generalist or specialist working outside the UK. 

Table of Contents 

The early chapters consider the philosophical basis and principles of environmental health, and skills and knowledge 
requirements such as communication skills, practice and promotion of environmental health including research skills; 
understanding business (as the regulated or as employee of the EHP); forms of construction from buildings to 
transport and related matters relevant to environmental health.  Also addressed is how environmental health is 
delivered in the UK and Republic of Ireland demonstrating the range of organisations that contribute. A chapter is 
devoted to the role of law and its enforcement in environmental health. The chapter on human physiology and health 
addresses toxicology and radiation and health as well as communicable diseases.  The following few chapters address 
the specific risk areas and aspects of environmental health, housing and the domestic environment, food and food 
safety, the work and leisure environments, water and environmental health, air and air quality, pest management and 
vector control, waste and land and related issues, noise and vibration. The final chapters consider specific issues, such 
as environmental management systems, environmental health in disasters, environmental health at sea and air ports 
and the international dimension. 

 

Contributors 

Include distinguished academics, and practitioners from the public and commercial sectors, including Professors 
David Ormandy (Warwick University), Rosalind Malcolm (Surrey University) and Virginia Murray (Health Protection 
Agency) Gai Murphy (Salford University). Other contributors include John Questier (Food Standards Agency) Jill R 
Meara, Lakshman Karalliedde, Babatunde Olowukure, (Health Protection Agency), Jonathan Hayes (Moto Hospitality 
Ltd), Stuart Wiggans, (Asda Stores Ltd), Angela Tanner and Iain Pocknell Crawley Borough Council, Sandra Westacott 
(Southampton Port Health Authority), Bernard Forteath (Past  President of IFEH and REHIS), Steve Pedley and Kathy 
Pond (University of Surrey), Stephen Hedley (Kings College, London) Jeff Cooper (President International Solid Waste 
Association) 
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